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EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER REGION 19 

 
RFP AWARD SUMMARY 

RFP TITLE: New, Used & Refurbished Commercial Utility Vehicles and Related- ESC Region 19 
Purchasing Cooperative 

RFP NUMBER:    12-6772 
RFP OPENING DATE:   April 25, 2012 
CONTRACT TERM: Date of Award until May 31, 2013 with the option to extend in 12 month increments not to 

exceed 36 months in the aggregate 
 (Extended by ESC Region 19 until May 31, 2014) 
FUNDING SOURCE:   Various Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative members 
RFP’s ISSUED:               2 
RESPONSES:               2  
ADVERTISEMENT DATES:  April 6th & April 13th

 
, 2012 

BOARD MEETING DATE:  July 19th

  
, 2012 

RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD             KN Enterprises, LLC 
     Moto Electric Vehicles 
     _______________ 
TOTAL (estimated)                 $600,000 / year  
 
EXPLANATIONS:  
 
 Award of this contract will enable ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative members and Region 19 to purchase, lease and rent 
utility vehicles and services stated when required during the contract period. Contact vendors for details, catalogs and special pricing.  
 
 
SPECIFICATIONS PROVIDED BY:   Royce Cleveland 
     ESC Region 19 
 
EVALUATION COMMITTEE:                              Nancy Alvarado 
     ESC Region 19 
 
     Martin Camacho 
     ESC Region 19 
 
 
 
 

 
ORDER INFORMATION: 

KN Enterprises, LLC 
Attn: Kipp Nall 
5823 N.Mesa St. # 832 
El Paso, TX. 79912 
575-382-3540 / 515-382-2060 
Fax: 575-373-2318 
www.kn-enterprises.com / lcsales@kn-enterprises.com 
 
Moto Electric Vehicles 
Attn: Brett Jackrel 
2426 Mayport Rd. 
Atlantic Beach, FL 32233 
239-896-0415 / 904-247-1818 
Fax: 904-247-2229 
www.motoelectricvehicles.com 
 
 

http://www.kn-enterprises.com/�
mailto:lcsales@kn-enterprises.com�
http://www.motoelectricvehicles.com/�
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SPECIAL CONDITIONS 

1. This bid will be for use by ESC Region 19 and its ESC Purchasing Cooperative members as well as any other members  
that join during the contract period. While Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative Membership is State-Wide, this contract is 
intended for use by local and surrounding area agencies participating in the ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative. 

 
2. Please indicate which if any of the Purchasing Cooperative Members your company could not or would not be able to 

 provide services to under this agreement? 
  
 Region 19 Head Start Sites  ______ 
 Anthony ISD    ______ 
 Burnham Wood Charter School  ______ 
 Candlelighters of El Paso  ______ 
 Children’s Kingdom Learning Center ______ 
 Canutillo ISD    ______ 
 Christian Joy Center Academy  ______ 
 City of El Paso (all departments) ______ 
 City of Horizon    ______ 
 City of Socorro    ______ 
 Clint ISD    ______ 
 El Paso Academy East   ______ 
 El Paso Catholic Diocese  ______ 
 El Paso ISD    ______ 
 El Paso Community College  ______ 
 El Paso Housing Authority  ______ 
 El Paso MHMR    ______ 
 El Paso School for Excellence  ______ 
 El Paso Water Utilities   ______ 
 Fabens ISD    ______ 
 Father Yermo    ______ 
 Hudspeth County Sheriff  ______ 
 La Fe Preparatory School  ______ 
 Rio Grande Counsel of Governments ______ 
 San Elizario ISD   ______ 
 Socorro ISD    ______ 
 St. Mark’s School   ______ 
 St. Raphael School   ______ 
 Texas Tech University Health Sciences ______ 
 Tornillo ISD    ______ 
 UTEP     ______ 
 Ysleta ISD    ______ 
 YWCA of El Paso   ______ 
 
 
  

Vendors agree to service all Cooperative members 
 
 
 
 
 SEE  MEMBERSHIP LISTING ON WEB  SITE FOR OTHER MEMBERS OF ESC REGION 19 PURCHASING COOP. 
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SPECIAL CONDITIONS 

1. SPECIFICATION SHEETS MUST BE INCLUDED FOR ALL ITEMS THE VENDOR WISHES TO HAVE CONSIDERED FOR 
AWARD; THE ITEM # AS IT APPEARS ON THE PROPOSAL SHOULD BE AFFIXED FOR EASY IDENTIFICATION IN 
NUMERICAL ORDER FOR EASY ACCESS DURING THE EVALUATION

 

.  IN AN EFFORT TO IMPROVE SPECIFICATIONS 
FOR FUTURE PURCHASES, THE PURCHASING COOPERATIVE WILL REQUIRE COMPLETE DATA SPECIFICATIONS FOR 
THOSE PRODUCTS CURRENTLY REFERENCED ON THIS CONTRACT. 

2. INDIVIDUAL PURCHASING COOPERATIVE MEMBERS WILL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ORDERING AND PAYING AWARDED 
VENDORS DIRECTLY UNDER THIS CONTRACT. 

 
3. BY SIGNING THIS CONTRACT, VENDORS AGREE THAT PRICING IS THE BEST OFFER AVAILABLE AND PRICING WILL 

REMAIN DURING THE CONTRACT PERIOD.  
  
4. AWARDED VENDORS WILL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR COMMUNICATING WITH EACH COOPERATIVE MEMBER ON 

DELIVERY SCHEDULES AND SPECIAL SITUATIONS DURING THE ENTIRE TERM OF THE CONTRACT. 
 

5. ANY DISPUTES REGARDING PRODUCT QUALITY, DELIVERIES, AND OR PRICING ARISING OUT OF THIS CONTRACT WILL 
BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING/ OR CONFIRMED EMAIL TO THE ATTENTION OF THE ESC-REGION 19 PURCHASING 
MANAGER  BY BOTH PARTIES INVOLVED IN THE TRANSACTION RESULTING FROM THIS CONTRACT.  ADMINISTRATIVE 
HEARINGS ARE NOT ROUTINE AND WILL BE THE ARBITRATION METHOD ON ANY AND / OR ALL CONTRACT 
COMPLIANCE ISSUES FOR THIS CONTRACT. 

 
6. DUE TO ESCALATING FUEL AND RAW MATERIALS REQUIRED TO FACILITATE THE STATED REQUIREMENTS, PRICING 

SUBMITTED MUST ACCOUNT FOR FIXED PRICING DURING THE FIRST SIX MONTHS OF THE CONTRACT

 

.  NO PRICE 
INCREASE REQUESTS WILL BE ACCEPTED DURING THE FIRST SIX MONTHS, SHORT OF A NATIONAL DISASTER 
AND/OR FORCE MAJEURE. NO PRICE INCREASE REQUESTS DURING THE LAST SIX MONTHS OF THE CONTRACT WILL 
BE APPROVED WITHOUT A THOROUGH ESCALATION REVIEW BY COMMITTEE AND COOP MEMBERSHIP. THE BURDEN 
OF PROOF OF A PRICE INCREASE WILL BE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE AWARDED VENDOR. REGION 19 
PURCHASING COOPERATIVE MEMBERSHIP WILL BE THE SOLE DECIDER FOR BASIS ON WHETHER OR NOT THE PRICE 
INCREASE OR SUBSTITUTED PRODUCT WILL OR WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED. 

7. THE AWARD BASIS FOR ITEMS AWARDED UNDER THIS CONTRACT WILL BE: 
 
 PRICE           60% 
 COMPLIANCE TO SPECIAL CONDITIONS / REQUIRED QUESTIONS  20% 
 REFRENCES         20%  
 
8.  ALL LOW SPEED VEHICLES (LSV’s) AND / OR NEIGHBORHOOD ELECTRIC VEHICLES (NEV’s) ARE   
      CLASSIFIED BY THE STANDARDS GIVEN BY THE TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF MOTOR VEHICLES LISTED  
      BELOW. FOR MORE INFORMATION THE TXDMV LINK IS PROVIDED BELOW. 
 
     A VEHICLE IS CLASSIFIED AS AN LSV OR NEV IF IT HAS: 

• A NORMAL MAXIMUM SPEED OF 20-25 MPH (LSV) OR 20-35 MPH (NEV), 
• SEAT BELTS, 
• HEAD AND TAIL LIGHTS, 
• A WINDSHIELD, 
• A PARKING BRAKE, 
• TURN SIGNALS, 
• REAR-VIEW MIRRORS, 
• BRAKE LIGHTS, 
• REFELECTORS, AND  
• A VALID  17-DIGIT VEHICLE IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (VIN) 

 
http://www.txdmv.gov/vehicles/drivers/golf_carts.htm 
 

 
 
 
 
 

http://www.txdmv.gov/vehicles/drivers/golf_carts.htm�
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SPECIAL CONDITIONS 

9. ALL LSV AND NEV VEHICALS MUST MEET THE REQUIRED STANDARDS SET BY THE NHTSA - THE FEDERAL  
     VEHICLE SAFETY STANDARD 500, FOR MORE INFORMATION THE U.S. DEPARTMENT OF  
    TRANSPORTATION-FEDERAL MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY ADMINISTRATION LINK IS PROVIDED BELOW. 
 
      SUBPART B – FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICLE SAFETY STANDARDS  
 
     §571.500 STANDARD NO. 500; LOW SPEED VEHICLES.  
            (a) WHEN TESTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH TEST CONDITIONS IN S6 AND TEST PROCEDURES IN S7, THE  
    MAXIMUM SPEED ATTAINABLE IN 1.6 KM (1MILE) BY EACH LOW-SPEED VEHICLE SHALL NOT EXCEED MORE THAN 40  
                   KILOMETERS PER HOUR (25 MPH).  
            (b) EACH LOW-SPEED VEHICLE SHALL BE EQUIPED WITH: 
                 (1) HEADLAMPS, 
                 (2) FRONT AND REAR TURN SIGNAL LAMPS,  
                 (3) TAIL LAMPS,  
                 (4) STOP LAMPS,  
                 (5) REFLEX REFECTORS: ONE RED ON EACH SIDE AS FARTO THE REARAS PRACTIBLE, AND ONE RED ONE ON THE REAR,  
                 (6) AN EXTERIOR MIRROR MOUNTED ON THE DRIVER’S SIDE OF THE VEHICLE AND EITHER AN EXTERIOR MIRROR MOUNTED  
                     ON THE PASSENGER’S SIDE OF THE VEHICLE OR AN INTERIOR MIRROR,  
                 (7) A PARKING BRAKE,  
                 (8) A WINDSHIELD THAT CONFORMS TO THE FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICAL SAFETY STANDARD ON GLAZING MATERIALS  
                      (49 CFR 571.205).  
                 (9) A VIN THAT CONFORMS TO THE REQUIREMENTS OF PART 565 VEHICLE IDENTIFICATION NUMBER OF THIS CHAPTER AND,  
                (10) A TYPE 1 OR TYPE 2 SEAT BELT ASSEMBLY CONFORMING TO SEC. 571.209 OF THIS PART, FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICLE  

 
                       SAFETY STANDARD NO. 209, SEAT BELT ASSEMBLIES, INSTALLED AT EACH DESIGNATED SEATING POSITION. 

http://www.fmcsa.dot.gov/rules-regulations/administration/fmcsr/fmcsrruletext.aspx?reg=571.500 
 
 
10. ALL ADA SHUTTLE / TRANSPORTATION UTILITY VEHICLES MUST MEET ADA ACESSIBILITY GUIDELINES  
       FOR TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES. FOR MORE INFORMATION THE ADA ACESSIBILITY GUIDELINES  
       FOR TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES LINK IS PROVIDED BELOW. 
 
 §1192.23, MOBILITY AID ACCESSIBILITY 

(b) VEHICLE LIFT. - (1) DESIGN LOAD
(c) 

.  
VEHICLE RAMP. - (1) DESIGN LOAD

(d) 
. 

SECUREMENT DEVICES. - (1) DESIGN LOAD.
 

  

§1192.25 DOORS, STEPS AND THRESHOLDS. 
(a) SLIP RESISTANCE
(b) 

.  
CONTRAST

(c) 
  

DOOR HEIGHT
 

.  

§1192.27 PRIORITY SEATING SIGNS. 
 

http://www.access-board.gov/transit/html/vguide.htm#AP 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.fmcsa.dot.gov/rules-regulations/administration/fmcsr/fmcsrruletext.aspx?reg=571.500�
http://www.access-board.gov/transit/html/vguide.htm#AP�
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NEW / USED COMMERCIAL UTILITY VEHICLES

1. BURDEN CARRIERS, INDUSTRIAL TRUCKS AND TRAILERS AVAILABLE: 

  

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE         WARRANTY          BASE COST NEW        BASE COST USED

COLUMBIA PARCAR ANY AND ALL      ANY AND ALL  1 YEAR     $7,500.00  AVAILABILITY 

  

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA VAN      ELECTRIC  1 YEAR    $17,500 .00  AVALIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA REFUSE HAULER     ELECTIC  1 YEAR    $24,000 .00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA DROP SIDE      ELECTRIC  1 YEAR    $16,700 .00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA TILT BED      ELECTRIC  1 YEAR    $18,400 .00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA CARGO BED     ELECTRIC  1 YEAR    $16,000 .00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR UTILI TRUCK      ELECTRIC / GAS 1 YEAR     $6,500.00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR PAYLOADER      ELECTRIC  1 YEAR      $8,400.00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT UTILITY      ELECTRIC  1 YEAR      $9,250.00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SCOUT       ELECTRIC / GAS 1 YEAR      $8,200.00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART EXTENDAHAULER    GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YEAR      $9,800 .00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART SUPERHAULER      GAS / ELECTRIC 2 YEAR      $9,800.00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE ONE       GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YEAR        $7,000.00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE TWO                GAS  2 YEAR      $7,800.00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A DRIVE W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC 4 YEAR      $5,800 .00      $3,000.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A PTV W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC 4 YEAR      $6,800.00      $4,500.00 

DOOLITTLE DUMP TRAILER         ANY / ALL   N/A  1 YR      $3,800.00     AVAILIBILITY 

DIAMOND C TRAILERS         ANY / ALL   N/A  1 YR      $1,400.00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR     UTILITRAILER   N/A  1 YR     $1,640.00          N/A 

COLUMBIA PARCAR            MVP           ELECTRIC  1 YR    $14,700.00   AVAILIBILITY 

 

        AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 
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BURDEN CARRIERS, INDUSTRIAL TRUCKS AND TRAILERS AVAILABLE: CONT 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE          ENERGY TYPE        WARRANTY              BASE COST NEW      

CITECAR  ELECTRO INDUSTRIAL BUDDY      ELECTRIC              3 YR LIMITED              $13,438.98   $11,938.98 

BASE COST USED 

  2 PASSENGER UTILITY TRUCKS             WARRANTY 
  STANDARD / # 3EIB-2PUTSTD  
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO INDUSTRIAL BUDDY      ELECTRIC              3 YR LIMITED              $19,119.00   $17,119.00 
  2 PASSENGER UTILITY TRUCKS            WARRANTY 
  DELUXE / # 3EIB-2PUTDLX 

** Note vehicle is not street legal** 
 

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC                      3 YR LIMITED             $12,153.00  $11,153.00 
  LSV 2 PASSANGER LQ               WARRANTY 
  UTILITY FREIGHT / #EBB-2PLQUF  

        AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 

2. COMMERCIAL VEHICLES AND CARTS AVAILABLE: 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE              WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW           

COLUMBIA PARCAR ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL            1 YR     $7,500         AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA VAN      ELECTRIC            1 YR    $17,500         AVALIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA REFUSE HAULER     ELECTIC             1 YR    $24,000         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA DROP SIDE      ELECTRIC             1 YR    $16,700         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA TILT BED      ELECTRIC             1 YR    $18,400         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA CARGO BED     ELECTRIC             1 YR    $16,000         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR UTILI TRUCK      ELECTRIC             1 YR     $6,500        AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR PAYLOADER      ELECTRIC             1 YR      $8,400        AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT UTILITY      ELECTRIC             1 YR      $9,250        AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SCOUT       ELECTRIC             1 YR      $8,200        AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART EXTENDAHAULER    GAS / ELECTRIC             2 YR      $9,800        AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART SUPERHAULER     GAS / ELECTRIC             2 YR      $9,800        AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE ONE     GAS / ELECTRIC             2 YR        $7,000        AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE TWO               GAS              2 YR      $7,800         AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A DRIVE W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC            4 YR      $5,800            $3,000.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A PTV W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC            4 YR      $6,800.00            $4,500.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART DRIVE Y DRE/ A      GAS / ELECTRIC            4 YR      $5,500.00            $2,800.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ANY / ALL          ANY / ALL            4 / 2 YR      $5,500.00            $2,800.00 

COLUMBIA PARCAR   MVP          ELECTRIC              1 YR    $14,700.00        AVAILIBILITY 
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AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

COMMERCIAL VEHICLES AND CARTS AVAILABLE: CONT 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE          ENERGY TYPE          WARRANTY            BASE COST NEW      

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED            $9,941.55   $8,941.55 

BASE COST USED 

  LSV 2 PASSANGER                WARRANTY 
  UTILITY STANDARD / #EBB-2PUSTD 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY    ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED             $10,786.56  $9,786.56 
  LSV 2 PASSANGER                WARRANTY 
  UTILITY STANDARD HARD DOOR   

#EBB-2PUSTDHD 
 
 

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC        3 YR LIMITED           $13,128.48  $12,128.48 
  LSV 2 PASSANGER                 WARRANTY 
  UTILITY DELUXE   

#EBB-2PUDLX 
 
 

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED             $15,292.05  $14,292.05 
  LSV 2 PASSANGER                 WARRANTY 
  UTILITY DELUXE HARD DOOR   

#EBB-2PUDLXHD 
 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC            3 YR LIMITED             $11,578.68  $10,578.68 
  LSV 2 PASSANGER DELIVERY               WARRANTY 
  #EBB-2PD 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED   $13,486.41  $12,486.41 
  LSV 4 PASSANGER                 WARRANTY             
  MOUNTAINEER   

#EBB-4PMNT 
 
 
 
         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 

 

3. STOCKCHASERS, PART PICKERS AND EXPIDITERS AVAILABLE: 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE              WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW       

COLUMBIA PARCAR STOCK CHASER         ELECTRIC 24/48 V  1 YR     $5,700.00       AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR CHARIOT         ELECTRIC   1 YR     $3,300.00       AVAILABILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR EXPIDITER         ELECTRIC   1 YR     $4,900.00       AVAILABILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR TUGGER                ELECTRIC   1 YR     $6,980.00       AVAILABILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR ANY / ALL         ELECTRIC   1 YR     $3,300.00       AVAILABILITY 

  

       
 AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

         MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO BID 
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NEW / USED COMMERCIAL UTILITY VEHICLES

4. TOW TRACTORS AND TRAILERS AVAILABLE: 

  

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY       BASE COST NEW   

KIOTI TRACTOR   ANY / ALL          DIESEL            4 YR  $12,500                AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

MCCORMICK COMPACT    ANY / ALL                       DIESEL             3 YR  $12,700  AVAILABILITY 

DOOLITTLE DUMPS TRLS  ANY / ALL            N/A            1 YR.  $3,800.00       AVAILABILITY 

DIAMOND C TRALIERS  ANY / ALL                         N/A            1 YR  $1,400.00        AVAILABILITY 

TRACTOR IMPLEMENTS: 

ANY / ALL CAT. 0, 1, 2 & 3 POINT IMPLEMENTS 
EXAMPLES: AUGERS, POST HOLE DIGGERS, ROTORY MOWERS, BRUSH HOGS, FINISH MOWERS, ROTO-TILLERS, AREATORS, 
BLADES, BOX BLADES, GANNON BLADES, ROCK RAKES, CONCRETE MIXERS, SEEDERS, SPREADERS, RIPPERS, PLOWS, CULTIVATORS, HARROWS, 
DICS, BORDER DISKS, FORK LIFT ATTACHMENTS, KOYLER MANUFACTURE FRONT END LOADERS AND 3 PT BACKHOES, CARRY ALLS, DIRT 
SCOOPS, AREAN DRAGS, SEED PLANTERS, OVER SEEDERS AND MANY MORE. 

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

TOW TRACTORS AND TRAILERS AVAILABLE: CONT 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE       WARRANTY       BASE COST NEW      

CITECAR  ELECTRO TRANSIT BUDDY   N/A            1 YR PARTS                   $11,995.00       $10,995.00 

BASE COST USED 

  15 PASSANGER TRAILER LQ      WARRANTY 
  #ETB-15PTLQ 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO TRANSIT BUDDY   N/A                    3 YR PARTS                 $12,995.00       $11,995.00 
  15 PASSANGER TRAILER XE      WARRANTY 
  #ETB-15PTLQ 

 

TRACTOR IMPLEMENTS: N/R 

         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 
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5.  PERSONNEL CARRIERS, SCOOTERS, GOLF CARTS AND CARTS AVAILABLE:  
     (PLEASE LIST NUMBER OF PASSANGER SEATING) 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE         ENERGY TYPE             WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW          

COLUMBIA PARCAR CHARIOT      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $3,300 .00        AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR EXPIDITER      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $4,900.00        AVALIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SHUTTLE C6      ELECTIC  1 YR    $7,350.00                     AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR EAGLE LE 2      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $6,880.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR EAGLE SE 2      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $7,580.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 2 GOLF      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $8,900.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 2 TOUR      ELECTRIC  1 YR     $9,100.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 2 TOUR AC      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $10,400.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 4 TOUR       ELECTRIC  1 YR      $10,300.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 4 TOUR AC      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $11,150.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT 2&4    ELECTRIC  1 YR      $10,200.00         AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR E/A 2     GAS / ELECTRIC  4 YR      $5,550.00            $2,800.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR E/A PTV 2     GAS / ELECTRIC  4 YR      $6,200.00            $4,000.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART CONCIERGE 4/6        GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YR      $7,800           AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART CONCIERGE 6/8      GAS / ELECTRIC 2 YR      $9,700.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MVP 14 PASSENGER     ELECTRIC  1 YR      $16,800.00         AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL  1 YR      $3,300.00         AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL  2 - 4 YR      $5,550.00         AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART PERSONAL SECURITY     GAS / ELECTRIC 2 YR      $9,300.00          AVAILIBILITY 
   VEHICLE 

   

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 
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PERSONNEL CARRIERS, SCOOTERS, GOLF CARTS AND CARTS AVAILABLE: CONT 
     (PLEASE LIST NUMBER OF PASSANGER SEATING) 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE        WARRANTY         BASE COST NEW     

CITECAR  GOLF CART 2 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                 $6,868.75  $5,868.75 

BASE COST USED 

  #GC-2P      LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 2 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                 $7,719.00  $6,719.00 
  BUBBLE - #GC-2PB    LIMITED WARRANTY 
 

 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 2 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                  $9,551.25  $8,551.25 
  UTILITY XL - #GC-2PUXL    LIMITED WARRANTY  
 

 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 2 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                  $10,688.75  $9,688.75 
  UTILITY DELUX - #GC-2PUDXL   LIMITED WARRANTY  
 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 4 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                    $7,250.00  $6,250.00 
  (BACK TO BACK) - #GC-4PRF   LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 4 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                    $7,756.25  $6,756.25 
  (FORWARD FACING) - #GC-4PFF   LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 4 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                   $10,688.75  $9,688.75 
  (WHEELCHAIR) - #GC-4PWC   LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 4 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                   $9,857.50  $8,857.50 
  UTILITY (FORWARD FACING) -   LIMITED WARRANTY 
  #GC-4PFFU 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 6 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                  $8,468.00  $7,468.00 
  (FORWARD FACING) - #GC-6PFF   LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
 
CITECAR  GOLF CART 4 PASSENGER   ELECTRIC         3 YR                  $7,900.00  $6,900.00 
  (BACK TO BACK) - #GC-6PRF   LIMITED WARRANTY 

          

AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 
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6.  UTILITY VEHICLES AND TRUCKS AVAILABLE: 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE               WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW    

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA VAN      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $17,500.00 AVAILIBILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA REFUSE HAULER     ELECTIC  1 YR    $24,000.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA DROP SIDE          ELECTRIC  1 YR    $16,700.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA TILT BED      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $18,400.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA CARGO BED     ELECTRIC  1 YR    $16,000.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR UTILI TRUCK      ELECTRIC  1 YR     $6,500.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR PAYLOADER      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $8,400.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT UTILITY      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $9,250.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SCOUT       ELECTRIC  1 YR      $8,200.00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART EXTENDAHAULER    GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YR      $9,800.00  AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART SUPERHAULER  GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YR      $9,800 .00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE ONE     GAS / ELECTRIC  2 YR        $7,000 .00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE TWO               GAS   2 YR      $7,800.00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A DRIVE W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC 4 YR      $5,800.00     $3,000.00 

YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR. E/A PTV W/ BED     GAS / ELECTRIC 4 YR      $6,800.00     $4,500.00 

COLUMBIA PARCAR             MVP      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $14,700.00 AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR         ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL  1 YR      $3,300.00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART         ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL  2-4 YR      $5,550.00 AVAILIBILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART  PERSONAL SECURITY     ANY / ALL  2 YR      $9,300.00 AVAILIBILITY 
     VEHICLE  

 

         AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY         BASE COST NEW          

INCLUDED IN PREVIOUS SECTIONS 

BASE COST USED 

          

         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 
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NEW / USED COMMERCIAL UTILITY VEHICLES

7. UTILITY TERRAIN VEHICLES (UTV’S) AVAILABLE: 

  

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE     WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW       

KIOTI TRACTORS  MECHRON  DIESEL                18 MONTH VEHICLE       $12,250.00                AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

                     24 MONTHS POWER 
                      PER MANUFACTURE 
  
POLARIS          RANGER ANY / ALL           GAS / DIESEL         18 MONTH VEHICLE          $12,500.00                AVAILABILITY 
      ELECTRIC           24 MONTHS POWER 
                    PER MANUFACTURE 
              

       
  AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

          MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO BID 

 

 

 

8. ALL TERRAIN VEHICLES (ATV’S) AVAILABLE: 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW          

YAMAHA        ANY / ALL  GAS  NONE  $3,750.00   AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

   

       
  AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

          MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO BID 
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10. TRUE ZERO TURN MID MOUNT AND FRONT MOUNT MOWERS AVAILABLE;  

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY   BASE COST NEW     

GRASSHOPPER  ANY / ALL FRONT MOUNT       GAS / PROPANE/ DIESEL       1 YR  $8,950.00         AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

              
GRASSHOPPER  ANY / ALL MID MOUNT       GAS / PROPANE/ DIESEL       1 YR  $5,000.00         AVAILABILITY 
              
GRASSHOPPER  FRONT MOUNT SERIES              GAS / PROPANE/ DIESEL       1 YR ATTACHED        AVAILABILITY 
        
GRASSHOPPER  616T / 44” / 48”        GASOLINE        1 YR                   $8,950.00        AVAILABILITY 
            
GRASSHOPPER  620T / 48” / 52” / 52”r       GASOLINE        1 YR                   $9,670.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  723T / 48” / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r      GASOLINE        1 YR                  $10,805.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  727T / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r          GASOLINE        1 YR                  $11,785.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  729B / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r           GASOLINE        1 YR                  $11,785.00        AVAILABILITY 
   
GRASSHOPPER  735DT / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r      GASOLINE        1 YR           $12,180.00        AVAILABILITY 
    
GRASSHOPPER  721DT / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r      DIESEL        1 YR           $13,400.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER       725DT / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r / 72” / 72”r      DIESEL        1 YR           $14,970.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER       729T / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r / 72” / 72”r      GASOLINE        1 YR           $14,630.00        AVAILABILITY 
    
GRASSHOPPER       930D / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r / 72” / 72”r      DIESEL        1 YR                   $17,715.00       AVAILABILITY 

GRASSHOPPER       932 / 52” / 52”r / 61” / 61”r / 72” / 72”r      GASOLINE        1 YR           $16,400.00       AVAILABILITY 

 
GRASSHOPPER FRONT MOUNT SERIES ACCESSORIES: GRASS COLLECTORS, VAC ASSEMBLIES, REMOTE VAC, POWER VAC SYSTEMS, BROOMS, 
DOZER BLADES, ENCLOSURES, TIRE CHAINS, POWER FOLD DECKS, MULCHING PACKAGES, SEAT KITS, ROLLER KITS, AERA-VATORS, TURBINE 
BLOWERS, DETHACHER, EDGER EDGE-EZE, SHIELDED SPRAYERS, SNOW THROWERS AND PROPANE KITS. 
 

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY   BASE COST NEW     

GRASSHOPPER  MID MOUNT MOWERS       GAS / PROPANE/ DIESEL       1 YR  ATTACHED        AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

 
GRASSHOPPER  124 / 41” / 48” / 52”       GASOLINE        1 YR                   $5,000.00        AVAILABILITY 
            
GRASSHOPPER  226V / 52” / 61”        GASOLINE        1 YR                   $6,500.00        AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  223 / 52” / 61”         GASOLINE        1 YR                  $7,500.00         AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  227 / 52” / 61” / 72”          GASOLINE        1 YR                  $9,150.00         AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER  329B / 52” / 61”                  GASOLINE        1 YR                  $9,400.00         AVAILABILITY 
   
GRASSHOPPER  335 / 61” / 72”        GASOLINE        1 YR           $10,100.00         AVAILABILITY 
    
GRASSHOPPER  321D / 48” / 52”        GASOLINE        1 YR           $11,430.00         AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER        325D / 61” / 72”                DIESEL        1 YR           $12,215.00         AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER                    329 / 52” / 61”         GASOLINE        1 YR           $11,874.00         AVAILABILITY 
 
GRASSHOPPER                 430D / 52” / 61” / 72”        DIESEL        1 YR                   $14,150.00         AVAILABILITY 

GRASSHOPPER        432 / 61” / 72”          GASOLINE        1 YR           $12,775.00         AVAILABILITY 

GRASSHOPPER MID MOUNT SERIES ACCESSORIES: ANTI-SCALP ROLLER KITS, EDGER EDGE-EZE, HEIGHT ADJUST KITS, LIGHT KITS,  
MULCHING PACKAGES, FOLDABLE ROPS, SEAT KITS, SHIELD SPRAYERS, SUN CANOPIES, POWER VACS AND PROPANE KITS.  

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 
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         MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO BID 

11. EMERGENCY UTILITY VEHICLES AVAILABLE; 

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY      BASE COST NEW       

COLUMBIA PARCAR UTILI TRUCK 911 AMBULANCE     ELECTRIC          1 YR                $9,500.00  AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR  ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL          1 YR                $9,500.00  AVAILABILITY 

POLARIS    ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL          PER   $17,900.00   N/R 
           MANUFACTURE 
 
POLARIS   RANGER / FIRE PACKAGE   GAS / DIESEL          PER    $19,500.00   N/R 
           MANUFACTURE 
 
POLARIS   RANGER / RESCUE PACKAGE   GAS / DIESEL         PER    $18,500.00   N/R 
           MANUFACTURE 
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART EXTENDAHAULER    GAS / ELECTRIC          2 YR                  $11,900.00 AVAILIBILITY 
   AMBULANCE   
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART SUPER HAULER      GAS / ELECTRIC         2 YR                  $11,900.00 AVAILIBILITY 
   AMBULANCE   
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART ANY / ALL      ANY / ALL                   2 YR                  $9,800.00 AVAILIBILITY 
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR.E/A PTV AMBULANCE M/M    GAS / ELECTRIC        4 YR              $9,445.00  AVAILIBILITY 
  
YAMAHA GOLF CART YDR.E/A AMBULANCE M/M     GAS / ELECTRIC        4 YR                              $8,445.00  AVAILIBILITY  

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE        WARRANTY           BASE COST NEW      

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED              $10,965.00            $9,965.00 

BASE COST USED 

  LSV 2 PASSENGER              WARRANTY 
  SECURITY / #EBB-2PS 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED              $17,345.00           $16,345.00 
  LSV 3 PASSENGER EMS              WARRANTY    
  PARAMEDIC RESPONDER   

#EBB-2PEMS 
 
 

CITECAR  ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD  ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED             $11,025.00             $10,025.00 
  BUDDY 3 PASSENGER EMS              WARRANTY 
  STREET LEGAL GOLF CART   

#ENB-3PEMS 
 
 

CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED              $10,945.00             $9,945.00 
  LSV 4 PASSENGER SECURITY               WARRANTY 

#EBB-4PS 
 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED              $13,475.00            $12,475.00 
  LSV 4 PASSENGER SECURITY               WARRANTY 
  HARD DOOR #EBB-4PSHD 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED    $14,160.00           $13,160.00 
  LSV 4 PASSENGER                WARRANTY             
  MUNICIPLE POLICE 

#EBB-4PMP 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY   ELECTRIC           3 YR LIMITED    $16,832.00           $15,832.00 
  LSV 4 PASSENGER                WARRANTY             
  MUNICIPLE POLICE 

HARD DOOR #EBB-4PMPHD 



15 
 

         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 

12. ADA SHUTTLE / TRANSPORTATION UTILITY VEHICLES AVAILABLE; 

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE        ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY      BASE COST NEW    

COLUMBIA PARCAR WHEELCHAIR MOBILITY      ELECTRIC             1 YR               $13,000.00 AVAILABILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SHUTTLE       ELECTRIC              1 YR               $7,580.00  AVAILABILITY 

YAMAHA GOLF CART CONCIERGE 4/6    GAS / ELECTRIC                 2 YR                $7,800.00  AVAILIBILITY 
      
YAMAHA GOLF CART CONCIERGE 6/8    GAS / ELECTRIC                 2 YR                $9,700.00  AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT 2&4       ELECTRIC               1 YR               $10,200.00 AVAILABILITY 

M&M VEHICLES  ADA GOLF CAR TRAM      PULL ONLY              LIMITED  $8,675.00  AVAILABILITY 
                                   8 PASSANGER + WHEELCHAIR 
 
CLUB CAR  ADA 6 PASSANGER  ELECTRIC / GAS                PER  $17,000.00 AVAILABILITY 
   + WHEELCHAIR              MANUFACTURE 

 

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE            ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW      

CITECAR  ELECTRO TRANSIT BUDDY      ELECTRIC 3 YEAR LIMITED            $12,287.50         $11,287.50 

BASE COST USED 

  9 PASSANGER LQ WHEELCHAIR        WARRANTY 
  #ETB-15PLQWC 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO TRANSIT BUDDY    ELECTRIC 3 YEAR LIMITED            $19,976.25         $18,976.25  
  11 PASSENGER ADA SHUTTLE                       WARRANTY 
  #ETB-11 PADA 
 
CITECAR  ELECTRO TRANSIT BUDDY    ELECTRIC 3 YEAR LIMITED            $23,475.00         $22,475.00  
  15 PASSENGER HARD DOOR                       WARRANTY 
  ADA SHUTTLE #ETB-15 PADAHD 

 

         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 
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13. FOOD INDUSTRY UTILITY VEHICLES AVAILABLE; 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW          

YAMAHA GOLF CART ADVENTURE TWO    GAS           2 YR                $11,300.00        AVAILIBILITY 

BASE COST USED 

   FOOD SERVICE BOX   
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART EXTENDAHAULER 72”    GAS            2 YR                $12,500.00        AVAILIBILITY 
   FOOD SERVICE  
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART SUPERAHAULER 72”    GAS            2 YR                $12,500.00         AVAILIBILITY 
   FOOD SERVICE 
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART ANY / ALL     GAS            2 YR                $11,300.00         AVAILIBILITY 
 
    
YAMAHA GOLF CART FAIRWAY LOUNGE    GAS            2 YR                $10,475.00         AVAILIBILITY 
   ADVENTURE TWO 
 
YAMAHA GOLF CART FAIRWAY LOUNGE    GAS            2 YR                $12,419.00        AVAILIBILITY 
   ADVENTURE TWO DELUXE 

       
 AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE       ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW          

INCLUDED IN PREVIOUS SECTIONS     

BASE COST USED 

         AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES  
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NEW / USED COMMERCIAL UTILITY VEHICLES

14. STREET LEGAL (LSV) LOW SPEED VEHICLES, (NEV) NEIGHBORHOOD ELECTRIC VEHICLES?  

  

MANUFACTURE       VEHICLE MODEL TYPE      ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY        BASE COST NEW          

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA VAN      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $17,500.00          AVAILIBILITY 

BASE COST USED 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA REFUSE HAULER     ELECTIC  1 YR    $24,000.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA DROP SIDE          ELECTRIC  1 YR    $16,700.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA TILT BED      ELECTRIC  1 YR    $18,400.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR MEGA CARGO BED     ELECTRIC  1 YR    $16,000.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT UTILITY      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $9,250.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR SUMMIT 2&4      ELECTRIC  1 YR      $10,200.00          AVAILIBILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 2 TOUR    ELECTRIC  1 YR      $9,100.00          AVAILABILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR NEV 4 TOUR    ELECTRIC  1 YR      $10,300.00          AVAILABILITY 

COLUMBIA PARCAR ANY / ALL NEV / LSV    ELECTRIC  1 YR        $9,100.00          AVAILABILITY 

       ACG   ANY / ALL NEV / LSV    ELECTRIC  1 YR        $8,700.00          AVAILABILITY 

        

AWARDED VENDOR – KN ENTERPRISES, LLC 

 

 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE           ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY             BASE COST NEW          

CITECAR          ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC     3 YR LIMITED            $9,425.00   $8,425.00 

BASE COST USED 

         LSV 2 PASSENGER #EBB-2P          WARRANTY 
           
 
CITECAR          ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY     ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED             $10,385.00  $9,385.00 
         LSV 4 PASSENGER SE             WARRANTY 
         #EBB-4PSE 

 
 

CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED       $13,130.00  $12,130.00 
          LSV 4 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
          HARD DOOR LE   
                                        #EBB-4PLEHD 

 
CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY     ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED             $10,017.50  $9,017.50 
         LSV 4 PASSENGER LE           WARRANTY 
         #EBB-4PLE 
 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC     3 YR LIMITED           $10,241.00  $9,241.00 
          LSV 6 PASSENGER #EBB-6P        WARRANTY 
           
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $11,907.00  $10,907.00 
         LSV 5 PASSENGER LQ          WARRANTY             
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          #EBB-5PLQ 
 
 

STREET LEGAL (LSV) LOW SPEED VEHICLES, (NEV) NEIGHBORHOOD ELECTRIC VEHICLES- CONT 

MANUFACTURE      VEHICLE MODEL TYPE           ENERGY TYPE      WARRANTY             BASE COST NEW          

 

BASE COST USED 

CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $14,813.00  $13,813.00 
           LSV 8 PASSENGER           WARRANTY             
                                  ROADSTER #EBB-8PRD 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $14,332.00  $13,332.00 
           LSV 6 PASSENGER           WARRANTY             
                                  ROADSTER #EBB-6PRD 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO BUBBLE BUDDY      ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $14,345.00  $13,345.00 
           LSV 6 PASSENGER           WARRANTY             
                                  DELUXE #EBB-6PDLX 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $7,568.75   $6,568.75 
           BUDDY 2 PASSENGER           WARRANTY             
                               STREET LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-2P 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $10,738.75  $9,738.75 
           BUDDY 2 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           UTILITY DELUXE STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-2PUDLX 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $10,251.25  $9,251.25 
           BUDDY 2 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           UTILITY XL STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-2PUXL 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $11,388.75  $10,388.75 
           BUDDY 4 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           WHEEL CHAIR STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-4PWC 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $7,950.00   $6,950.00 
           BUDDY 4 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           BACK TO BACK STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-4PRF 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $8,456.25   $7,456.25 
           BUDDY 4 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           FORWARD FACING STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-4PFF 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $10,557.50  $9,557.50 
           BUDDY 4 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           UTILITY STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-4PFFU 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $8,600.00   $7,600.00 
           BUDDY 6 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           BACK TO BACK STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-6PFR 
 
CITECAR           ELECTRO NEIGHBORHOOD    ELECTRIC      3 YR LIMITED    $9,168.00   $8,168.00 
           BUDDY 6 PASSENGER            WARRANTY 
           FORWARD FACING STREET                        
                               LEGAL GOLF CART #ENB-6PFF 

 

AWARDED VENDOR – MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 
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REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

1. PROVIDE 3 REFERENCES ( LARGE ACCOUNTS) YOUR COMPANY HAS DONE BUSINESS WITH IN PAST 12 MONTHS 
INCLUDING NAME OF CONTACT PERSON, PHONE NUMBER, EMAIL ADDRESS, AND DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES PROVIDED: 

 
 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – ON FILE 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – ON FILE 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2. LOCAL PERSON TO WORK WITH REGION 19 COOP MEMBERS INCLUDING NAME, PHONE NUMBER, CELL PHONE, AND  
EMAIL ADDRESS? 

 
KN ENTERPRISES, LLC  
 
KIPP NALL – 575-644-5315 – kippnall@yahoo.com 

   
 NICK ARAGON – 575-642-4669 – aragonnick@aol.com 
 
 CHAD MILLER – 575-636-3382 – chad@kn-enterprises.com 
 
 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES 

 
 EDGE KAWASAKI – 10310 MONTANA AVE. EL PASO, TX. 79925 
 
 
 
 
 

3. YEARS DOING BUSINESS FOR SERVICES SUBMITTED FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION? 
 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – 21 YEARS 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – ESTABLISHED IN 2006 

 
 
 
 
 

4. DOES VENDOR AGREE TO KEEP ALL ESC REGION 19 PURCHASING COOPERATIVE MEMBERS INFORMED VIA  
ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATIONS AND CURRENT WITH REQUIRED DOCUMENTS? 

 
KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - YES 

 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - YES 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:kippnall@yahoo.com�
mailto:aragonnick@aol.com�
mailto:chad@kn-enterprises.com�


20 
 

 
 
 
 

 
REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

5. LIST MANUFACTURES / MAKES  OF VEHICLES VENDOR SELLS, CARRIES, SERVICES; 
 
 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YAMAHA GOLF CARTS, COLUMBIA PAR CAR, KIOTI TRACTORS, GRASSHOPPER MOWERS,  
ACG LSV (AMERICAN MADE), POLARIS, TERRA TOR CORP., EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT (MORIDGE MANUFACTURING), 
DOLITTLE TRAILERS, DIAMOND C TRAILERS  

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – CITECAR (SERVICE ONLY) KAWASAKI 

 
 
 
 
 

6. NUMBER OF EMPLOYEES;   WORKING AND RESIDING IN TEXAS? 
 
 
KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – ZERO EMPLOYEES RESIDING IN TEXAS. 
 
 HOWEVER SALESMAN NICK ARAGON SPENDS 100% OF HIS TIME AND DEDICATION IN THE STATE OF TEXAS SPECIFICALLY 
EL PASO COUNTY. OUR OWNER AND GENERAL MANAGER SPEND 30-40% OF THEIR TIME WITH OUR CUSTOME BASE 
GROWING IN EL PASO, TX. OUR GOAL IS TO INCREASE BOTH OUR NUMBER OF CUSTOMERS IN THE STATE OF TEXAS BUT 
GROW BUISNESS AS A WHOLE INCLUDING RESIDING EMPLOYEES IN THE STATE OF TEXAS. 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – 7 EMPLOYEES – 0 IN TEXAS 

 

      7. SALE OF USED COMMERCIAL UTILITY VEHICLES – SOLD AS IS / REFURBISHED, LIST DETAILS; 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –  
SOME OF OUR VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT ARE SOLD AS IS, OTHER VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT ARE SOLD WITH A 90 DAY 
WARRANTY. 
 

 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – USED – 6 MONTH WARRANTY 

 

 

       8. COST FOR DELIVERY OF UTILITY VEHICLES PURCHASED, RENTED OR LEASED; 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – DELIVERY PRICE IS DETERMINED BY MILEAGE. KN ENTERPRISES, LLC OFFERS THE FIRST 40 MILES 
AT NO CHARGE. MOST APPLICATIONS FOR FREIGHT ARE QUOTED AT THE TIME OF BUISNESS TRANSACTION. 
 

 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – SHIPPING IS FOB (BUILT IN TO PRICE) 

 

 

       9. LIST TYPES OF ENERGY POWERED VEHICLES AVAILABLE / VENDOR SELLS? (GAS, ELECTRIC (AC-DC), ETC.)  
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KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – GASOLINE, ELECTRIC (AC-DC), DIESEL 
 

 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – ELECTRIC AC METER & DE METER 

10. DOES VENDOR HAVE PARTS AVAILABLE OR CAN OBTAIN PARTS FOR ALL OR MOST UTILITY VEHICLE MODELS /                                                                                     
MANAUFACURES? 

REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES 
 

 
MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - YES – OVER 50,000 PARTS IN STOCK FOR OUR VEHICLES 
 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –- 7 WORKING DAYS UNLESS ON BACK ORDER 

RESPONSE TIME;  

MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – ON CALL 

 

        

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - 28% 

MARK UP OVER COST ON PARTS; 

MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - LIST PRICE AVAILABLE ONLINE 
 
 
 

         
 

DOES VENDOR INSTALL PARTS, IF SO LIST LABOR COST; 

          
KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - $45.00 PER HOUR / UP TO $90.00 PER HOUR DEPENDING ON VEHICLE.   
 
 

   MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES, $60.00 PER HOUR IF NOT IN WARRANTY 
 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - YES - $45.00 PER HOUR / UP TO $90.00 PER HOUR DEPENDING ON VEHICLE.  PLUS SERVICE CALL 
  

DOES VENDOR OFFER ON SITE REPAIR? LIST LABOR COST;  

MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – TBD  
          

       

               KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - WARRANTY ALL SERVICE 1 YEAR WARRANTY, ON PARTS DEPENDS ON MANUAFACTURES  

WARRANTY ON PARTS AND SERVICE;  

 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – 1 YEAR 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES  

ARE PARTS NEW AND FROM AN AUTHORIZED VENDOR?  
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MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES 
 
 

    11. IS VENDOR CERTIFIED / QUALIFIED TO SERVICE ALL TYPES OF UTILITY VEHICLE MODELS / MANUFACTURERS? 

REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES,  
OUR EMPLOYEES ARE CERTIFIED AND QUALIFIED TO SERVICE ALL TYPES OF UTILITY  MODELS/ MANUFACTURES  
 
 
MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - YES 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - $45.00 PER HOUR / UP TO $90.00 PER HOUR DEPENDING ON VEHICLE 

LABOR COST PER HOUR;  

 
MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - $60.00 PER HOUR 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - WITHIN 24 TO 48 HOURS 

RESPONSE TIME;  

 
 

MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - ASAP 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - TBD BY MILEAGE 

COST FOR PICK UP AND DELIVERY;  

 
 

MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - TBD 

 

  13.  WILL VENDOR SERVICE ALL EXISTING UTILITY VEHICLES OWNED BY COOPERATIVE MEMBERS? 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC - YES 
 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES 
 
 

14. DOES VENDOR HAVE A SHOP TO REFURBISH UPGRADE / CUSTOM BUILT VEHICLES, STATE SHOP DETAILS;  

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES PLUS FABRICATION 
 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES, SHOP IN FLORIDA OR AVAILABLE THROUGH KAWASAKI DEALER 
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 15. DOES VENDOR HAVE THE CAPABILITY AND CERTIFICATION TO UPGRADE / CUSTOM BUILD NEW, USED OR EXISTING                                                                                                        
UTILITY VEHICLES? IF SO PLEASE EXPLAIN; 

REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES, ANY AND ALL, ALL METAL WORK HAS A LIFE TIME WARRANTY. ALL COSMETIC WORK 
 INCLUDING PAINT AND UPHOLSTERY, 1 YEAR WARRANTY 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES, UPGRADES AVAILABLE 

 

16. DOES VENDOR HAVE CERTIFIED TECHNICIANS? HOW MANY? IF SO PROVIDE A COPY OF ANY LICENSES, CERTIFICATES                                                     
OR TRAINING. 

 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES WE HAVE CERTIFIED TECHNICIANS. KN CURRENTLY HAS 4 CERTIFIED TECHNICIANS. 
COPIES OF CERTIFICATIONS ARE ATTACHED TO ORIGINAL PAPERWORK. 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES, 2 EMPLOYEES 

 

 

17. DOES VENDOR PROVIDE TRAINING ON MAINTENANCE OF VEHICLES TO CUSTOMERS? 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES – KN ENTERPRISES PROVIDES TRAINING ON MAINTENANCE OF VEHICLES TO CUSTOMERS. 
 
EVERY YEAR KN ENTERPRISES AND SPECIFIC MANUFACTURES (YAMAHA GOLF CARS) HOST A TRAINING SEMINAR 
THAT IS OFFERED TO ALL CURRENT, PAST AND FUTURE CUSTOMERS TO ATTEND. THIS SEMINAR GOES OVER VEHICLE 
MAINTENANCE, FLEET MANAGEMENT, REPAIR AND GENERAL KNOWLEDGE OF GAS AND ELECTRIC GOLF CARS, UTILITY 
VEHICLES AND INDUSTRIAL TRUCKS. BESIDES OUR SEMINARS KN ENTERPRISES OFFERES HANDS ON TRAINING 
WITH EACH CUSTOMERAT EVERY DELIVERYOF A VEHICLE TO HELP CUSTOMERS BETTER UNDERSTAND THEIR 
OBLIGATIONS FOR MAINTENANCE AND WARRANTY. IN THE FUTURE WITH MORE INTREST, KN ENTERPRISES WILL GLADLY  
OPEN ITS DOORS TO DO MORE MANUFACTURE SPECIFIC MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SEMINARS.  

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES 

 

 

18. DOES VENDOR PROVIDE VEHICLE ACCESSORIES SUCH AS VEHICLE COVERS, VEHICLE ENCLOSURES ETC.? 
      LIST ACCESSORIES BELOW; OR ATTACH TO RFP 
 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES – VEHICLE ENCLOSURES, ANY AND ALL ACCESSORIES 
 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – YES  
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19. DOES VENDOR OFFER LEASING, RENTAL OR PURCHASE, IF SO STATE EACH AND TERMS; 

REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – 
 
GOLF CARTS 2 SEAT $65.00 PER DAY / 4 SEAT $95.00 PER DAY / 6 SEATS $120.00 PER DAY / 8 SEAT $145.00 PER DAY 
 
LONG TERM GOLF CAR LEASING, CALL FOR SPECIAL RATES 
 
GOLF CAR TRASH TRAILERS - $25.00 PER DAY 
 
POLARIS UTV LEASING - $120.00 PER DAY  
 
KIOTI MECHRON – DIESEL LEASING $145.00 PER DAY 
 

 LONG TERM POLARIS & KIOTI UTV LEASING – CALL FOR SPECIAL RATES 
 
 TRAVEL TRAILERS (ALL SIZES) $100.00 PER DAY PLUS CONVENIENCE PACKAGE 
 
  
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES -  

 LEASING AVAILABLE ON CASE BASIS  

PURCHASING AVAILIABLE 

 

20. DOES VENDOR DISCOUNT ON QUANTITY OR VOLUME PURCHASES, RENTALS OR LEASED VEHICLES, LIST DISCOUNTS? 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –  
YES, CALL ON DISCOUNTS AS IT DEPENDS ON VEHICLE TYPES. SEE ABOVE FOR WARRANTY DETAILS 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO 
 
  

21.  VENDORS RETURN POLICY ON PURCHASED / LEASED UTILITY VEHICLES;  

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –  
ON PURCHASED VEHICLES, NO RETURNS, ON LEASED UTILITY VEHICLES MUST ADHERE BY LEASE AGREEMENT 
 SIGNED AT TIME OF LEASE AND SHOULD BE RETURNED IN SAME CONDITION. 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO 

 

22. DOES VENDOR HAVE A STORE FRONT, SHOP IN EL PASO?  

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –  
NOT AT THIS TIME, VENDOR HAS A HUB STORE IN LAS CRUCES, NM. AND PHYSICAL ADDRESS IN  
 EL PASO AT 5823 N. MESA ST. #832 

 
 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – NO  
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23. DOES VENDOR HAVE CATALOGS AND OR A WEB SITE FOR COOPERATIVE MEMBERS? 

REQUIRED QUESTIONS AND INFORMATION FOR AWARD CONSIDERATION 

KN ENTERPRISES, LLC – YES, BOTH A CATALOG AND WEBSITE www.kn-enterprises.com 
 

 
 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES - YES 

 

24. LIST ANY UTILITY VEHICLES AND / OR SERVICES RELATED TO PROPOSAL NOT MENTIONED; 

 KN ENTERPRISES, LLC –  
LEASING OF ALL EQUIPMENT, RECREATIONAL VEHICLES, TRACTOR LEASING AND REPAIR, EQUIPMENT REPAIR, 
FABRICATION, SALES, PARTS, SERVICE FOR ANYTHING AND EVERYTING WE SELL. 

 

 MOTO ELECTRIC VEHICLES – N/A 

 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 Approved by: __________________________________________Date: ________________ 
                         (James R. Vasquez – Executive Director)                          (June 6, 2012) 
 Approved by: __________________________________________Date: ________________ 
                        (James R. Vasquez – Executive Director)                          (April 30, 2013) 
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