EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER REGION 19
RFP AWARD SUMMARY

RFP TITLE: Specialty Foods- ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative

RFP NUMBER: 11-6688

RFP OPENING DATE: July 11, 2011

CONTRACT TERM: Date of Award until July 31, 2012 with the option to extend in 12 month

increments not to exceed 36 months in the aggregate
(Extended by Region 19 until July 31, 2013)
(Extended by Region 19 until July 31, 2014)

FUNDING SOURCE: Various Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative members
RFP’s ISSUED: 17

RESPONSES: 3

ADVERTISEMENT DATES: June 21% and June 27", 2011

BOARD MEETING DATE: October 20, 2011

RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD Ben-EKeith-Fooeds as of 10/12/12

Sazonadores Sol (HUB Qualified)
Quintero’s Meat Co. (HUB Qualified)

TOTAL (estimated) $1,000,000/ year

EXPLANATIONS:

Award of this contract will enable the Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative members to purchase the stated goods during
the contract period if required. In all instances, administration recommended low bid meeting specifications.

SPECIFICATIONS PROVIDED BY: Adele Balesh
Canutillo ISD
EVALUATION COMMITTEE: Royce Cleveland

ESC Region 19

Nancy Alvarado
ESC Region 19

Martin Camacho
ESC Region 19

ORDER INFORMATION:

Ben EKeith-Foods-as of 10/12/12
3205 Broadway SE
AlbuguergueNM-87105-0104
800-675-2949/505-843-7766
Fax:-505-222-8321

Sazonadores Sol (HUB Qualified)
Attn: Enrique Solis

1703 Montana Ave. Ste. 1

El Paso, TX 79902

915-490-6517

Fax: 915-587-6855 (ask for tone)
enrique.solis@sazonadores.com



http://www.benekeith.com/�
mailto:eakania@benekeith.com�
mailto:enrique.solis@sazonadores.com�

ORDER INFORMATION: Cont.

Quintero’s Meat Co. (HUB Qualified)
Attn: Juan Garcia

4413 Durazno St.

El Paso, TX 79905

915-351-2471

Fax: 915-351-2474
jerry.qgmc@aol.com

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

1. This bid will be for use by ESC Region 19 and its ESC Purchasing Cooperative members as well as any other members that
join during the contract period. While Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative Membership is State-Wide, this contract is intended
for use by local agencies participating in the ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative.

2. Please indicate which if any of the Purchasing Cooperative Members your company could not or would not be able to provide
services to under this agreement?

Region 19 Head Start Sites
Anthony ISD

Burnham Wood Charter School
Candlelighters of El Paso

Children’s Kingdom Learning Center
Canutillo ISD

Christian Joy Center Academy

City of El Paso  (all departments)
City of Horizon

City of Socorro

Clint ISD

El Paso Academy East

El Paso Catholic Diocese

El Paso ISD

El Paso Community College

El Paso Housing Authority

El Paso MHMR

El Paso School for Excellence

El Paso Water Utilities

Fabens ISD

Father Yermo

Hudspeth County Sheriff

La Fe Prepatory School

Rio Grande Counsel of Governments
San Elizario ISD

Socorro ISD

St. Mark’s School

St. Raphael School

Texas Tech University Health Sciences

Tornillo ISD
UTEP
Ysleta ISD

EEHTTEPPFEREETTTEPPPREET

YWCA of El Paso


mailto:jerry.qmc@aol.com�
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SPECIAL CONDITIONS (cont)

Evaluation and award recommendation will be based on 70% pricing and 30% of vendor’s ability to provide services as specified rated by
previous sales history.

The ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative reserves the option to award in groups, award individually, or award all or none, or a
combination of, whatever is determined to be in the best interest of the membership.

This specialty bid will be for deliveries as required during the period of August 2011 through August 2012.

Pricing will remain fixed for the first six (6) months with price increases or decreases accepted only after justification has been documented
by the ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative.

All purchase orders and invoicing will be directly with each district using this contract.

Deliveries will take place at any time during working hours except during breakfast and lunch serving times when staff is not available to
verify and check in orders.

Deliveries will take place between 6:45 AM and 10:30 AM to the cafeterias.
Deliveries will take place two up to three days per week during the contract period.
Monthly menus for each campus will be provided to delivery personnel upon request.

Delivery vendor personnel will check with each cafeteria manager in person one day per week agreed upon mutually so that orders for the
following week can be given to the vendor.

The awarded vendors will be responsible for coordinating with each agency utilizing this contract on any conditions regarding deliveries.
Any unacceptable product will be picked up the next business day after original delivery and replaced with acceptable product.
Any omitted product from a delivery will be delivered the next business day.

All product delivered will be sealed and free from leaks, and be kept at a temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit and be delivered in clean
sanitary cases.

CN labeling or product nutritional specification sheets to be provided with bids.

Individual monthly statements will be sent for each campus the vendor has delivered to at the close of each month during the
contract period.

Vendor will leave two clear legible invoices at each campus location upon each delivery showing the location, unit
descriptions, and unit price as well as an invoice total.

Cafeteria delivery locations, contact personnel, phone numbers, and other specific information will be provided to awarded
vendors upon award unless requested prior to bid submissions.

Vendors are not required to bid on all districts to be considered for award.

Each Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative member reserves the option to add locations and quantities during the contract
period.

Quantities ordered will be on an as needed basis by the ESC Region Purchasing Cooperative members.

INSURANCE COVERAGES WILL BE SUBMITTED WITH PROPOSALS INCLUDING GENERAL LIABILITY, VEHICLE
LIABILITY, AND WORKERS COMPENSATION

MINIMUM DELIVERY WILL BE $350 PER ORDER WITH NO SERVICE FEES, HOWEVER, VENDOR SHOULD STATE
THE COST OF DELIVERY WHEN ORDERS ARE LESS THAN $350 PER DROP. IF THE COOP MEMBER ORDERS $350
BUT THE VENDOR CANNOT COMPLETE THE ORDER IN FULL, THE COST OF A DELIVERY CHARGE WILL NOT
APPLY



REQUIRED QUESTIONNAIRE

1.

Total number of employees living and working in El Paso, Texas?
Ben-E-Keith-Foods-9

Sazonadores Sol — 1

Quintero’s Meat Co. - 25

Total number of delivery trucks located in El Paso, Texas?
BenE-Keith-Foods—5

Sazonadores Sol — 1

Quintero’s Meat Co. - 6

Number of years in delivery business for schools and education facilities?
Ben-E-Keith—22 years

Sazonadores Sol - 0

Quintero’s Meat Co. — 11

Will vendor deliver to other ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative members?
Ben-E-Keith--Yes

Sazonadores Sol — Yes

Quintero’s Meat Co. -Yes

If yes, what is the minimum order required for delivery to each site?
Sazonadores Sol — $150.00 - under $150.00 there is a $30.00 delivery charge

Quintero’s Meat Co. - $350.00 — under $75.00 there will be a $10.00 delivery charge

Provide three (3) educational or related references company has provided food delivery service to in the
southwest during the past 12 months? Information must have Agency Name, Contact person, person’s title,
phone number, mailing address, and email address if available.

All references on file

CN labeling or product nutritional specification sheets to be provided with bids.

Most CACFP Packaged Meat Products require a Child Nutrition (CN) label.
Please specify if products fall under this category.

Nutrition Facts Must Be Available At The Time Of Award Ready For Posting On The R19 Website Bid Contracts




Product - Spices, Sauces

1. Chipotle Peppers in Adobo Sauce- 24/300

Awarded Vendor

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price
—San-Mareos 2417 6z $30-18
95114/685042

2. Diced Red Pimentos -24/300

BenE-Keith-Feods

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
—DBunbar 24 /300 $33 76— BenE KeithFoods
145000/685060

3. Mole Paste- 10lbs. (sauce)

Awarded Vendor

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price
KROH 415 gal $49.32
— 4800191677/ 660390

4. Chopped Garlic - 5 Ib.

BenE-Keith-Feods

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
McGCormick 1/725 $37.07 Ben E Keith Foods
———932689./ 774709

5. Anise Seed - 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Herdez 24 /7 oz. $43.20

6. Basil Leaf- 7 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Sazonadores Sol 1/7 oz $3.15

7. Bay Leaves -10 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Sazonadores Sol 1/10oz. $4.90

Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol

Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol

Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol




Product - Spices, Sauces

8. Cinnamon Sticks- 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Sazonadores Sol 1/11b. $15.25 Sazonadores Sol
9. Cumin-5Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol 1/51b. $25.00 Sazonadores Sol
10. Cream of Tartar - 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MecGCormick——————————1 /25 0z $9.59 Ben EKeith-Foods
932610/774050

11. Dill Weed - 5 oz.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MecCormick 1/ 50z $9.23 Ben E Keith Foods
——900210217/ 774062
12. Ginger - 1 Ib.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MeCormick———————— 1/ 1 1b- $7.93 BenEKeith-Foods
——932608/ 774232
13. Lemon Pepper - 1 Ib.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Sazonadores Sol 1/260z. 8.25 Sazonadores Sol
14. Dry Mustard - 1 Ib.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
—Colmans 1/ 441b- $20.34 BenEKeith-Foods
—25110/ 7744714



Product - Spices, Sauces

15. Nutmeg - 1lb.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MGCormick 1/ 1 1b- $13.24 Ben EKeith-Foods
900223101/ 774125

16. Oregano Leaf - 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol 1/11b. 4.80 Sazonadores Sol

17. Parsley Flakes - 10 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MeGCormick————— 1/ 100z $7.62 Ben EKeith Foods—
———932680/ 774723

18. Red Crushed Pepper - 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol 1/11b. $4.80 Sazonadores Sol

19. White Pepper - 1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol 1/11b. $9.60 Sazonadores Sol

20. Poultry Seasoning - 12 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Malu 1/12oz. $2.65 Sazonadores Sol
21. Sage - 8 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

MeCormick 1/ 60z $8-36 Ben E Keith-Foods
———932311 /774190

22. Season Salt - 5 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MecCormick 1/ 4.51b- $11.23 BenEKeith-Foods
— 900018589/ 774396




Product - Spices, Sauces

23. Thyme -1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Sazonadores Sol 1/11b. $7.50 Sazonadores Sol

24. Vanilla Extract - 1 gal.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

—02554 [ 777026

25. Almond Extract - 1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
MeCormick 1/1at $¢E2 10 Ran F Kaith Enndec
MecCormicl 1/ gt $53.10 BenE Keith-Foods
90002355/ 777005

26. Soy Sauce - 1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
— Keith—Clements —— 1 gal $4.44 Ben E-Keith Foods
——02851/ 661093

27. Teriyaki Sauce - 1 gal.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——01444 /660122

28. Sweet ‘N’ Sour Sauce - 1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
LaChoy 1 gal $1560———Ben E_Keith Foods
4430012600/660112

29. Honey - 6/5 Ib.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——BB1010/793072




Product - Canned Goods

30. Low Fat Condensed Milk -24 14 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

w. —2 #1462 —$4—1—73—B€H—%K—9+t—h—;999—8_ o i
— 5272910245/ 798022

31. Bakers Joy -12/1

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——J001 —AM900-/ 698010

32. Butter Buds Spray Mist- 20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Butter Buds 2414 oz $38-75 BenEKeith-Foods
——51205/779401

33. Canola Oil - 20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——58503BEK/ 779189

34. Olive Qil - 20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Import 6/ 1 gal $57.97 BenE Keith-Foods
— 779189

35. Lime Juice -1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——582084620121

36. Black Olives — Sliced 6/10

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Ronson 6410 $40.00 BenEKeith-Foods
—4031RS /1682104



Product - Canned Goods

37.

38.

Green Olives — Manzanilla — Small- 4/1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Awarded Vendor

—4056RS/682101

Sliced Beets- 6/10

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Awarded Vendor

Awarded Vendor

———4604500801/650122
39. Garbanzo Beans -6/10
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price
Allen 6410 $24.89
— 74213001 /650100

40.

41.

42.

43.

Kidney Beans- 6/10

Ben E Keith Foods

Awarded Vendor

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price
Allen 6410 $27.06
41213001 /650110

Black Beans -6/10

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

Red Wine Vinegar -1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price

BenE-Keith-Feods

Awarded Vendor

Awarded Vendor

0083404686012

Dijon Mustard -1 gal.

Awarded Vendor

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price
Frenchs 2/-105 62 $40-84
81071 /664027

10

BenE-Keith-Feods



Product - Canned Goods

44. Hot Sauce — Louisiana -1 gal. (hot & spicy)
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Cattlemans {(hot & spicy}——1 gal $3.69 Ben E- Keith Foods

45. Liquid Smoke- 1 gal.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
=170/ 66085

46. Parmesan Cheese -1 Ib.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
ine 12 /1 $56-20 BenEKeith-Foods
702725007/750035

47. Pepperoncini — Sliced 4/1

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Bay-Valley 411 gal- $37.05 Ben E-Keith Foods
———1273020117/685011

Product - Frozen, Refrigerated ltems (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

48. Blueberries — Frozen -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

49. Provolone Cheese- 6/5

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
335624752005

50. Swiss Cheese- 6/5

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
—Land-O-Lake 645 $80-06 BenEKeith-Foods
—46447./ 760008
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Product - Frozen, Refrigerated ltems (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

Smoked Ham -10 lbs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

Ham — Boneless -10 Ibs.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

Beef Fajitas- 10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 10 Ibs. $3.19 Ib. fresh or frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.

Beef — Inside Round- Trimmed — Choice 10-20 Ibs

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

Brisket -10-20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

Packer Choice 65 Ibs. $2.99 1b. fresh Quintero’s Meat Co.

average weight

56. Pork chop — Center Cut -4 oz.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 101b. $2.29 1b. frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.
57. Pork Loin -10-20 Ibs.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Swift 2+91bs ew—S2 657 1bs cw fresh Ben E Keith Foods

58.

Jumbo Chicken Wings- 10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Tvyenn & /5 lhe $<A1 24 fraozan Ran F Kaith Enndec
Tyson 6/ 51bs- $61.34 frozen Ben E Keith Foods

12



Product - Frozen, Refrigerated ltems (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

59. Pollock Fillet — 4 0z. — IQF

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

60. Cod Fillet — 4 oz. — IQF

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

21020002/453041

61. Beef Tender Loin -10-20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Packer 2-/5-cw- $8. 54 H#Hew- fresh Ben EKeith-Foods
— 500151

62. Strip Beef Steak- 4 oz.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 10 Ibs. cs. $2.98 |Ib. fresh Quintero’s Meat Co.

63. Ground Turkey -20 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

64. Shrimp — Cooked — Peeled- Deveined /250-350 ct.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

65. Salad Shrimp -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

HOS 5/21h— $53.02 frozen Ben E Keith- Foods

66. Diced Pork — 1" Cubes 34" - Trimmed - 10 Ibs

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 10 Ibs. $1.59 Ib. frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.

13



Product - Frozen, Refrigerated ltems (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

67. Diced Beef — 1" Cubes 34"- Trimmed -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 10 Ibs. $3.29 1b. fresh Quintero’s Meat Co.

68. Beef Stew Diced Frozen raw beef cubes, 34 cut, Must meet IMPS and USDA select or better standards.
Made from beef chuck, boneless.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

— 506024

69. Ground Beef Patties, 85/15 blend- Fresh or Frozen — No fillers — Raw Patties Must meet IMPS #1136
(Not to exceed 20% fat) — 5 to 1 patties, 3 0z. 8/20 blend.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 14 Ibs. $2.89 Ib. frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.

70. Bulk Ground Beef, 85/15 blend, Fresh or Frozen — No fillers — Must meet IMPS #1136 (not to exceed 17% fat)
Fat / Lean ratio must be clearly stated on each box — packed in 10 Ib. plastic bags — 4 per case

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Quintero’s 40 Ibs. $2.29 1b. frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.

71. Turkey, Ground 85/15 no less 80/20 — Cooked, white and dark meat- No skin with ground product or fillers-
Delivered fresh or frozen- USDA Selector better and inspected.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

72. Turkey, Diced, Combo dark and white, %4’ to 1’ cube, cooked or raw: specify-Delivered: frozen
Trimmed of visible fat- 20-40 Ibs. packs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Jennie—0O 2/51h—  $2360 frozen Ben E- Keith-Foods
——6406/492053

14



Product - Frozen, Refrigerated Items (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

73. Turkey Ham Supreme — delivered frozen — USDA select or better

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

74. Turkey Breast, Deli sliced — Chunked and formed, no fillers - Delivered frozen — USDA inspected, Select or better

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Tvuesaon a/121h $<E2 A0 fraoch Ran F Kaith Enndec
Fyson 642 1b- $53.40 fresh Ben E Keith Foeds

——217363/492195—{sliced 7507

75. Chicken Drumsticks, raw — Delivered: frozen -USDA inspected — 2.6 0z., with skin.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
—Fysen——————096/3.502 $42.36 frozen Ben E_Keith Foods
——9657/487112

76. Chicken pulled, combo dark & white- Boneless, cooked, Delivered: frozen- USDA inspected- no skin.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Tvueaon 1/101h $2Q A5 frozan Ran F Kaith Enndec
Tyson 1/101b- $29.45 frozen Ben E Keith-Foods

——9093-/488148

77. Chicken Thighs, raw, un breaded — Delivered: frozen - USDA inspected — 3-4 0z. with skin

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Tyson 4/ 101b- $65-34 frozen BenEKeith-Foods
{boneless/skinless 3-0z,)
—314/487149

78. Chicken, diced, combo white and dark — Boneless %2 to ¥4 cube, raw or cooked; specify — Delivered frozen
USDA inspected.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Tuesaon 2 /5 1lh $20 BER frozan Ran F Kaith Enndec
Tyson 2/51b- $30.56 frozen BenE Keith-Foods

—3112/487036

15



Product - Frozen, Refrigerated ltems (Meats, fruits, fish, chicken, turkey & cheese)

79. Sliced American Cheese — 120-160 ct. — USDA inspected, all milk protein — No artificial cheese product

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

and O | aka 2 /5 1h $26 96 frach Ban E Keaith Engds
ahG =aKe Z o100~ LI HeSh o= etnr+60646S

|
it

——46325/7350563 160 ¢t

80. Mozzarella Cheese, processed, sliced — M/MA 160-180 ct. - Milk product — USDA inspected
No artificial cheese product.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

81. Mozzarella Cheese sticks — 1 oz. portions per case- Part Skim -USDA inspected — No artificial cheese product.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Schreitber—————— 160/1 0z $4153 fresh BenEKeith-Foods
19148/ 747110

82. Mozzarella Shredded Cheese — milk product / part skim — USDA inspected - No artificial cheese product

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor

C 2 A DAairv 415 1h [N~ els] frach Ran F Kaith Enndec

E & A Dairy 4/51b- $55.83 fresh BenE Keith-Foods
——10018PS/ 747067

83. Turkey Chorizo — boneless, skinless turkey thigh meat-USDA approved — no fillers, cereals or preservatives
Nutritional analysis required.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Delivered (fresh/frozen) Awarded Vendor
Apache 10 Ibs. $2.39 1b. frozen Quintero’s Meat Co.

Product - Dry Goods

84. Sliced Almonds -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

85. Dry Roasted Peanuts -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
—Azar 1/30Hh— ———  $4662 — BenE Keith Foods
——6122606/ 795058
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Product - Dry Goods

86. Walnut Pieces -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

#0527/ 795229

87. Pecan pieces- 10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Keith 1/ 51b- $33-89 BenEKeith-Foods
—B795227

88. Sesame Seeds -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——4A7644/ 774286

89. Poppy Seeds -5 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

—9323534774798

90. Raisins- 30 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Malley Pride—— 1/301bs $45.67 Ben E Keith Foods
— 00001

91. PC No Calorie Sweeteners -4000 ct.

a) PC Sweet ‘N’ Low
b) PC Equal
c) PC Splenda

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Keith-52065/ 675018 1/ 2000¢t- $20.02
—Equal —675030-/112001-E 1/2000¢t $27.86 Ben E Keith Foods
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Product - Dry Goods

92. PC Liquid Coffee Creamers -100 ct.

a) Hazelnut

b) Amaretto

¢) lIrish Cream

d) French Vanilla

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

International Delight

639047/ 0256500 2/ 500z $19.18
-639050/0254500 2/ 5002 $19.18 Ben E-Keith Foods
639051 /0254400 2/ 500z $19.18
-639048/0254800 2/ 500z $19.18

93. Sugar Free Crystal Lite - 6/1

a) Lemonade
b) Fruit Punch

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Crystal Light
4300083930 12/ 2 gak $36.49 Ben E-Keith Foods
4300083931 12 /2gal $36.49 Ben E-Keith Foods

94. Croutons -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

Kaith 1/101bh $1018 Ban E Keaith Engds
“ehh - amam s = 4 e Kehtn+=004aS

T 1O

95. Chow Mein Noodles -10 Ibs.
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

——4430012620/ 701010

96. Corn Flake Crumbs -10 Ibs
Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

———3800007612 /771070
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Product - Dry Goods

97. Lentils — Dry -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

—+£276920114

98. Navy Beans — Dry- 10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
C&E 1/ 20-1b- $16-33 BenEKeith-Foods
— NAV1020100

99. Split Peas — Dry -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
C&E 1/ 20-1b- $17.32 BenEKeith-Foods
———gsp1020100

100. Pasta- 20 Ibs.

a) Orzo

b) Ziti

c) Rotoni — Colored
d) Fusilli

e) Letters

f) Stars

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor

a)Zeregal8221 ——2/10 _$17.73 Ben £ Keith Food
boNe-bid————

6} Zerega/81268 — — 2/10- __g22.28 Ben £ Keith Food

d.)No bid
e.)No bid
f.)No bid

101. Wild Rice Blend -10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size Unit Price Awarded Vendor
Uncle Bens 6/36 0z $47.00 Ben E. Keith Foods
02004 / 654200

19



Product - Dry Goods

102. Brown Rice- 10 Ibs.

Brand/ Code Pack Size

Unit Price Awarded Vendor

—22311/654340

103. Long Grain -10 Ibs.

Unit Price Awarded Vendor

$24.06— Ben E Keith-Foeds

Brand/ Code Pack Size
Uncle Bens 1/ 251bs-
— 0311031 /654040

104. Butter Buds- 6/1

Brand/ Code Pack Size
— 51205

Approved by:

(James R. Vasquez or Designee)
(James R. Vasquez or Designee)

(James R. Vasquez)

Unit Price Awarded Vendor
$24. 30— BenE Keith-Foods
Date:

(August 23, 2011)
(May 30, 2012)
(June 19, 2013)
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	URFP AWARD SUMMARY
	3 Evaluation and award recommendation will be based on 70% pricing and 30% of vendor’s ability to provide services as specified rated by previous sales history.
	4 The ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative reserves the option to award in groups, award individually, or award all or none, or a combination of, whatever is determined to be in the best interest of the membership.
	5 This specialty bid will be for deliveries as required during the period of August 2011 through August 2012.
	6 Pricing will remain fixed for the first six (6) months with price increases or decreases accepted only after justification has been documented by the ESC Region 19 Purchasing Cooperative.
	7 All purchase orders and invoicing will be directly with each district using this contract.
	8 Deliveries will take place at any time during working hours except during breakfast and lunch serving times when staff is not available to verify and check in orders.
	9 Deliveries will take place between 6:45 AM and 10:30 AM to the cafeterias.
	10 Deliveries will take place two up to three days per week during the contract period.
	11 Monthly menus for each campus will be provided to delivery personnel upon request.
	12 Delivery vendor personnel will check with each cafeteria manager in person one day per week agreed upon mutually so that orders for the following week can be given to the vendor.
	13 The awarded vendors will be responsible for coordinating with each agency utilizing this contract on any conditions regarding deliveries.
	14 Any unacceptable product will be picked up the next business day after original delivery and replaced with acceptable product.
	15 Any omitted product from a delivery will be delivered the next business day.
	16 All product delivered will be sealed and free from leaks, and be kept at a temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit and be delivered in clean sanitary cases.
	24 INSURANCE COVERAGES WILL BE SUBMITTED WITH PROPOSALS INCLUDING GENERAL LIABILITY, VEHICLE LIABILITY, AND WORKERS COMPENSATION
	25 MINIMUM DELIVERY WILL BE $350 PER ORDER WITH NO SERVICE FEES, HOWEVER, VENDOR SHOULD STATE THE COST OF DELIVERY WHEN ORDERS ARE LESS THAN $350 PER DROP.  IF THE COOP MEMBER ORDERS $350 BUT THE VENDOR CANNOT COMPLETE THE ORDER IN FULL, THE COST OF A...

	UCN labeling or product nutritional specification sheets to be provided with bids.
	UMost CACFP Packaged Meat Products require a Child Nutrition (CN) label.
	U Please specify if products fall under this category.
	UNutrition Facts Must Be Available At The Time Of Award Ready For Posting On The R19 Website Bid Contracts

