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 EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER REGION 19 
RFP AWARD SUMMARY 

 
RFP TITLE: Infant & Baby Food, Supplies, and Related – ESC Region 19 Allied States 

Cooperative 
RFP NUMBER: 15-7079 
RFP OPENING DATE:  October 23, 2014 
CONTRACT TERM: Date of award until October 31, 2015 with an option to extend 12 month 

increments not to extend beyond 36 months in the aggregate  
 (Extended by Region 19 until October 31, 2016) 
 (Extended by Region 19 until October 31, 2017) 
FUNDING SOURCE: Various  
RFP’s ISSUED:              22 
RESPONSES:   2 
ADVERTISEMENT DATES:  El Paso Times September 26 and October 3, 2014 
BOARD MEETING DATE:  December 18, 2014 
  
RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD    Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc. dba Bryant’s Market 
     Supreme Medical 
     ________________ 
TOTAL (estimated)                 $2,000,000.00/ year  
 
EXPLANATIONS:  
  
Award of this contract will enable ESC-Region 19 and its Purchasing Cooperative members to purchase the stated 
baby and infant requirements.  
 
 
SPECIFICATIONS PROVIDED BY:  Royce Cleveland 
    ESC Region 19 Allied States Cooperative  
 
EVALUATION COMMITTEE:             Royce Cleveland 
    ESC Region 19 Allied States Cooperative 
 
    Martin Camacho 
    ESC Region 19 Allied States Cooperative 
     
    Mary Jane Lopez 
    ESC Region 19 Allied States Cooperative 
 
Contact Information:  
 
Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc. dba Bryant’s Market  
Esther Najera / Terry Apodaca 
1757 George Dieter #107 
El Paso, TX 79936 
915-757-1800 
Fax: 915-757-7788 
www.bryantsmarket.com / esther@bryantsmarket.com / terry@bryantsmarket.com  
 
Bryant’s Market #3 
Gabbi Maggos 
10010 Audobon 
El Paso, TX 79924 
915-751-6275 
Fax: 915-757-4394 

http://www.bryantsmarket.com/
mailto:esther@bryantsmarket.com
mailto:terry@bryantsmarket.com
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Bryant’s Market #4 
Gisela Mendoza 
324 N. Zaragoza 
El Paso, TX 79907 
915-858-9299 
Fax: 915-858-8233 
 
Bryant’s Market #5 
Jasmine Rodriguez 
2934 Pershing 
El Paso, TX 79903 
915-564-3710 
Fax: 915-564-9630 
 
Bryant’s Market #7 
Martha Escobar 
5470 Doniphan Suite A 
El Paso, TX 79932 
915-587-0670 
Fax: 915-587-0729 
 
Bryant’s Market #8 
Gabi Castañon 
10725 N. Loop Suite 105 
El Paso, TX 79927 
915-859-5786 
Fax: 915-859-2636 
 
Bryant’s Market #10 
Betty Fiero / Rachel Valles 
850 N. Carolina Space 11 
El Paso, TX 79915 
915-629-7580 
Fax: 915-594-3314 
 
Bryant’s Market #11 
Bertha Meza 
1757 George Dieter #107 
El Paso, TX 79936 
915-62-9219 
Fax: 915-629-9259 
 
 
Supreme Medical 
Jeff Powell / Karen Lathan  
PO BOX 4497 
Theodore, Al. 36582 
1-800-461-1370 ext. 308 
Fax: 1-800-461-1277 
www.suprememedical.com / bids@suprememedical.com  

http://www.suprememedical.com/
mailto:bids@suprememedical.com
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Item Description        
          
1. Newborn disposable diapers (1- 12 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
  
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid – Kendall discontinued  
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality CR1001 
 Pack Size   200 case 
 
 
 
 
 
2. Small disposable diapers (12 – 18 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell,  Luvs, or Little Ones. 
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 46.10   $ 45.00   $ 44.63 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN80018A 
 Pack Size   272 case 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality CR2001 
 Pack Size  168 case 
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3. Medium disposable diapers (16 – 28 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 46.10   $ 45.00   $ 44.63  
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN80028A 
 Pack Size   224 case 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.  First Quality CR3001 
 Pack Size   144 case 
 
 
 
 
4. Large disposable diapers (22 – 35 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 46.10   $ 45.00   $ 44.63 
  
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN80038A 
 Pack Size   192 case 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality CR4001 
 Pack Size   124 case 
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5. X Large disposable diapers (30 lbs. and up) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell,Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 44.29   $ 43.00   $ 42.40 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN80048A 
 Pack Size   176 case  
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality CR5001 
 Pack Size   108 case  
 
 
 
 
6. XX Large disposable diapers (45 lbs. and up) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 44.29   $ 43.00   $ 42.40 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN80058A 
 Pack Size   144 case 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 29.75   $ 28.50   $ 27.50 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality CR6001 
 Pack Size   92 case 
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7. Small Uni-Sex Pullups (12-16 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell,Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid – unavailable 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate - No Bid – unavailable 
 
 
 
 
 
8. Medium Uni-Sex Pullups (16 – 28 lbs.)  Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell,  Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 36.49   $ 35.00   $ 34.40 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN70063BA 
 Pack Size   104 case 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 35.50   $ 34.00   $ 33.45 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality WP7001/1 
 Pack Size   104 case 
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9. Large Uni-Sex Pullups (28 – 35 lbs.) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 36.19   $ 34.85   $ 34.10 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN70064BA 
 Pack Size   92 case 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 35.50   $ 34.00   $ 33.45 
 
 Brand/ Order No. First Quality WP8001/1 
 Pack Size   92 case 
 
 
 
 
 
10. X Large Uni-Sex Pullups (30 lbs. & up)  Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 34.40   $ 33.85   $ 32.25 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN70065BA 
 Pack Size   76 case 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 35.50   $ 34.00   $ 33.45 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality WP9001/1 
 Pack Size   76 case 
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11. XX Large Uni-Sex Pullups (45 lbs. & up) Acceptable brand- Pampers, Huggies, Kendell, Luvs, or Little Ones. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 34.40   $ 33.85   $ 32.25 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   Kendall – KN70 
 Pack Size  68 case 
 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 cs.   40 case min.   250 case min.  500 case min  
 Price    
 Ext.   $ 35.50   $ 34.00   $ 33.45 
 
 Brand/ Order No.   First Quality WP9001/1 
 Pack Size   76 case 
 
 
 
 
12. Price list provided for items 1- 11 and other products not listed? 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 

Brand N/R        Yes  
 Minimum Order Information including discounts for larger order 
 Provided?        Yes  
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
   

Brand N/R        Yes  
 Minimum Order Information including discounts for larger order 
 Provided?        Yes  
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Special Conditions (item 13, 14, & 15) 
 
1. This item will be awarded on 65% pricing and 35% selection weight factors. 
2. Price lists should include S & H for various brackets to order from. 
3. Awarded vendor will have ability to change prices during contract period based on 
 Manufacturers published pricing due to economic fluctuations regarding raw costs, 
 Distribution costs and other variables 

 
  

13. Baby Food & Juices 
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.   
 
 Brand      Gerber 
 Price list provided?   Yes X 
 Minimum Quantity Order?  0 cases 
 Minimum Dollar Order ?   $ 0  
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical- Alternate - No Bid 
 
 
 
14. Formulas (Dry & Liquids) 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.   
 
 Brand      Abbott, Mead Johnson, Nutricia, Nestle 
 Price list provided?   Yes X 
 Minimum Quantity Order?  0 cases 
 Minimum Dollar Order ?   $ 0 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical- Alternate - No Bid 
 
 
 
 
15. Baby Bottles, Nipples, bibs, and Related 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid 
  
 
 Supreme Medical- Alternate - No Bid 
 
 
 
 
 



 10 

Special Conditions (item 16, 17, 18, 19, & 20) 
 

1. This item will be awarded on 65% pricing and 35% quality weight factors. 
2. Awarded vendor will have ability to change prices during contract period based on 

 Manufacturers published pricing due to economic fluctuations regarding raw costs, 
 Distribution costs, and other variables 

3. Items will be awarded individually due to minimum quantity shipments. 
 
 
16. Disposable Paper Towels - 100 cs. -  2-ply sheets made from virgin wood pulp, Resin to add strength when wet 
 Bleached to make absorbent,  36 rolls per case or comparable 
  
  
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical- Alternate - No Bid 
  
 
 
17. Refills for Disposable Receptors (item 12)   
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical- Alternate - No Bid 
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18. Disposable gloves - Non-latex, powder free, FDA standards for  Medical gloves  USDA accepted for maximum finger  
 Sensitivity, To be worn on either hand,  To be used for diaper changing and food preparation 
  
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
  
 
 Supreme Medical  
 
 100 cs  
 Price    $ 29.95 cs.    
 Ext.    
 Gloves per case   1000 / case 
 Boxes per case    10 
 Sizes available    S, M, L, XL 
 Brand/ Order No.   Tradex TI-V200 
 Sample provided   N/R 
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 100 cs  
 Price    $ 29.95 cs.    
 Ext.    
 Gloves per case   1000 / case 
 Boxes per case    10 
 Sizes available    S, M, L, XL 
 Brand/ Order No.   Tradex TI-V200 
 Sample provided   N/R 
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
 
 
 
19. Disposable Shoe covers - Impervious, non-slip, safe step shoe covers, One size fits all 
  
  
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 50 cs. 
 Price      
 Ext.    $ 15.99 case 
 Shoe covers per case   150 pr. 
 Boxes per case    1 
 Brand/ order No.   DYX2132 
 Sample provided   N/R 
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate 
 
 50 cs. 
 Price      
 Ext.    $ 15.99 case 
 Shoe covers per case   150 pr. 
 Boxes per case    1 
 Brand/ order No.   DYX2132 
 Sample provided   N/R 
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
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20. Baby Wipes - Hypo Allergenic,  Formulated to be gentle on skin, 80 sheets per pack or comparable 
  
  
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical 
 
 100 cs. 
 Price      
 Ext.    $ 20.99 case 
 Wipes per pack    96 / pack 
 Packs per case    8 cases 
 Brand/ Order no.   KN5399SP 
 Sample provided   N/R    
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – Alternate  
 
 100 cs. 
 Price      
 Ext.    $ 28.26 case 
 Wipes per pack    72 / pack 
 Packs per case    12 cases 
 Brand/ Order no.   CR16413 
 Sample provided   N/R    
 Quantity listed is minimum order 
  
 
 
21.   Please attach a price list of any other related items not mentioned that vendor sells, or catalog  
 as it will become part of the final award. Include discounts, costs, minimum orders, etc. 
 
 
 Eddie Bryant Enterprises, Inc.  -  No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical – No Bid 
 
 
 Supreme Medical - Alternate – No Bid 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Approved by: ______________________________________   Date: ________________________ 
   (Armando Aguirre – Executive Director)                             (December 2, 2014) 
  (Armando Aguirre – Executive Director)                             (September 18, 2015) 
  (Armando Aguirre – Executive Director)                             (September 30, 2016) 
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